Re: Treasury Dept. - 1099 for 2014

Subject: Re: Treasury Dept. - 1099 for 2014

From: Katie Kiefer <katie@southpark.la>

Date: 06/29/2016 11:38 AM

To: Marcus Lieber <marcus.lieber@armaninollp.com>, Robert Buente
<bbuente@1010dev.org>, Jessica Lall <jessica@southpark.la>

Marcus — updated W-9s attached for the following:

1. Precision Concrete Cutting
2. Catherine Chabot
3. StackFM / Accendo

Have been following up with Ideation Creation with no response; there company might be no
longer? I attached the 2011 W-9 we have on file if this could help clearing up that
Treasury Dept. doc. Let me know if it doesn’t.

Katie Kiefer
South Park BID
1100 S. Flower St., Suite #3400, Los Angeles, CA 90015

0. 213 663 1120

24/7: 866 560 9346

From: Marcus Lieber <marcus.lieber@armaninollp.com>

Date: Monday, May 23, 2016 at 3:44 PM

To: SPBID <katie@southpark.la>, Robert Buente <bbuente@l0lOdev.org>, Jessica Lall
<jessica@southpark.la>

Subject: RE: Treasury Dept. - 1099 for 2014

No rush on my account.

From: Katie Kiefer [mailto:katie@southpark.lal
Sent: Monday, May 23, 2016 3:39 PM

To: Marcus Lieber; Robert Buente; Jessica Lall
Subject: Re: Treasury Dept. - 1099 for 2014
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Re: Treasury Dept. - 1099 for 2014

WOW I need more coffee if I missed that connection. I will put out requests and get those
to you sooner rather than later.

Thx.

Katie Kiefer

South Park BID

Please note change of address:

1100 S. Flower St., Suite #3400, Los Angeles, CA 90015

0. 213 663 1120

24/7: 866 560 9346

From: Marcus Lieber <Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com <mailto:Marcus.Lieber@armaninolLLP.com>
>

Date: Monday, May 23, 2016 at 3:38 PM

To: SPBID <katie@southpark.la <mailto:katie@southpark.la> >, Robert Buente
<bbuente@l010dev.org <mailto:bbuente@l0l0dev.org> >, Jessica Lall <jessica@southpark.la
<mailto:jessica@southpark.la> >

Subject: RE: Treasury Dept. - 1099 for 2014

Hi Katie,

I'm your Armanino LLP contact.

Thanks,

Marcus Lieber
Supervisor
Business Management

ArmaninoLLP <http://http/armaninollp.com>
11766 Wilshire Blvd., Ninth Floor | Los Angeles, CA 90025
(310) 478-4148 x5794 main | (310) 703-1227 fax
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From: Katie Kiefer [mailto:katie@southpark.la <mailto:katie@southpark.la> ]
Sent: Monday, May 23, 2016 3:33 PM

To: Marcus Lieber; Robert Buente; Jessica Lall

Subject: Re: Treasury Dept. - 1099 for 2014

Please provide Armanino’s contact info and I will forward over the new W-9s.

THX.

Katie Kiefer

South Park BID

Please note change of address:

1100 S. Flower St., Suite #3400, Los Angeles, CA 90015

0. 213 663 1120

24/7: 866 560 9346

From: Marcus Lieber <Marcus.Lieber@armaninolLLP.com <mailto:Marcus.Lieber@armaninolLLP.com>
>

Date: Monday, May 23, 2016 at 3:17 PM

To: Robert Buente <bbuente@l0lOdev.org <mailto:bbuente@l0l0dev.org> >, Jessica Lall
<jessica@southpark.la <mailto:jessica@southpark.la> >, SPBID <katie@southpark.la
<mailto:katie@southpark.la> >

Subject: RE: FW: Treasury Dept. - 1099 for 2014

Hi Alt,

Here’s what to do regarding the IRS Notice:

* No response to the IRS required
* Request updated W-9 (see blank W-9 attached) from each vendor listed on page 3
* Once received, please forward the new W-9s to Armanino so we may update the

vendor’s profiles.
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Re: Treasury Dept. - 1099 for 2014

Thank you,

Marcus Lieber
Supervisor
Business Management

ArmaninoLLP <http://http/armaninollp.com>
11766 Wilshire Blvd., Ninth Floor | Los Angeles, CA 90025
(310) 478-4148 x5794 main | (310) 703-1227 fax

From: Robert Buente [mailto:bbuente@l0l0dev.org <mailto:bbuente@l@lOdev.org> ]
Sent: Saturday, May 21, 2016 10:03 AM

To: Marcus Lieber; Jessica Lall

Cc: Katie Kiefer

Subject: Re: FW: Treasury Dept. - 1099 for 2014

I think we need to double check these vendors TIN's and if they are wrong we'll need to
refile "something". Marcus am I close to being correct?

Thanks

Bob

Robert Buente
President/CEO

1010 Development Corporation

Sent from Outlook Mobile <https://aka.ms/sdimjr>

On Fri, May 20, 2016 at 2:29 PM -0700, "Jessica Lall" <jessica@southpark.la
<mailto:jessica@southpark.la> > wrote:

Hi Marcus — do you know how we should handle this??
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Re: Treasury Dept. - 1099 for 2014

Jessica Lall

South Park BID

Please note change of address:

1100 S. Flower St., Suite #3400, Los Angeles, CA 90015

0. 213 663 1112

c. 213 820 0837

24/7: 866 560 9346

From: Katie Kiefer <katie@southpark.la <mailto:katie@southpark.la> >
Date: Friday, May 20, 2016 at 2:08 PM

To: Jessica Lall <jessica@southpark.la <mailto:jessica@southpark.la> >
Subject: Treasury Dept. - 1099 for 2014

Jessica — received the attached letter in the mail with ATTN to Treasurer. Let me know if
we handle internally or if this gets sent over to Bob.

THX.

Katie Kiefer

South Park BID

Please note change of address:

1100 S. Flower St., Suite #3400, Los Angeles, CA 90015

0. 213 663 1120

24/7: 866 560 9346

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE:

This communication, including attachments, is for the exclusive use of the person or
entity to which it is addressed and may contain confidential, proprietary and/or
privileged information. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or
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Re: Treasury Dept. - 1099 for 2014

taking of any action in reliance upon, this information by persons or entities other than
the intended recipient is prohibited. If you received this by mistake, please contact the
sender immediately.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE:

This communication, including attachments, is for the exclusive use of the person or
entity to which it is addressed and may contain confidential, proprietary and/or
privileged information. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or
taking of any action in reliance upon, this information by persons or entities other than
the intended recipient is prohibited. If you received this by mistake, please contact the
sender immediately.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE:

This communication, including attachments, is for the exclusive use of the person or
entity to which it is addressed and may contain confidential, proprietary and/or
privileged information. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or
taking of any action in reliance upon, this information by persons or entities other than
the intended recipient is prohibited. If you received this by mistake, please contact the
sender immediately.

— Attachments:
Precision Concrete Cutting W-9 2016[1].pdf 52.0 KB
W-9 TEMPLATE[1][1]-signed[1].pdf 127 KB
W-9 - StackFM - 2016[1].pdf 114 KB
W9 Linh Ho.pdf 103 KB
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